
Berger Paints India Gets 
Runner-Up Spot In 

The Coveted ICC Water Awards 2022

Berger Paints India is proud to 
announce that we have been 
recognised as a Runner-up in the 
prestigious ICC Water Awards 2022 
in Industrial Water & Waste Water 
Management.
 
Indian Chamber of Commerce (ICC) 
is an eminent consortium of 
business organisations in Eastern 
and Northeastern India. Several 
large corporate groups in the 
country and overseas are affiliated 
with this organisation.

This is the 1st edition of the ICC 
Water Awards that recognises 
excellence in the sphere of the 
water intensive industry for the year 
2021-2022. 

The award evaluates an 
organisation’s concern towards 

water management by conservation 
of water, saving energy towards 
water intensive activities, optimising 
fresh water usage by various 
technologies used for water 
treatment, wastewater treatment 
and recycling process through 
adequate measures as a corporate 
commitment towards ensuring that 
the people and planet are 
adequately protected from the 
adverse effect of wastewater and to 
curb demanding water needs.

As an organisation, at Berger Paints 
India, we are truly committed to our 
environmental responsibilities. 
Water conservation is of utmost 
importance to us and we pledge to 
continue and excel in our 
sustainable approach toward 
Industrial water management.  


